

RESOLUTION R14-17

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE VILLAGE ADMINISTRATOR TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT WITH JUTTE EXCAVATING, INC. PENDING APPROVAL OF THE OEPA/DEFA LOAN APPLICATION PACKAGE

WHEREAS, the Village of Covington has determined that the Village Wastewater Treatment Plant located in the Village is in need of renovations, including but not limited to, the installation of an effluent pumping station and UV disinfection system;

WHEREAS, the Village Administrator solicited bids for the Wastewater Treatment Plant Phase 1 renovation project;

WHEREAS, Jutte Excavating, Inc. submitted a bid to complete said project and its bid was the lowest and best bid;

WHEREAS, OEPA/DEFA requires the Village to tentatively award the project pending the OEPA/DEFA loan program's approval;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT Resolved by the legislative authority of the Village of Covington, State of Ohio, a majority of all members elected thereto concurring, that:

Section 1: The Council of the Village of Covington hereby tentatively awards the Waste Water Treatment Facility Phase 1 Improvements Project to Jutte Excavating, Inc. pending approval from the OEPA/DEFA loan program.

Section 2: the Village Administrator of the Village of Covington is authorized to enter into the contract with Jutte Excavating, Inc. for the completion of the Waste Water Treatment Facility Phase 1 Improvements Project.

Section 3: this resolution shall be in effect at the earliest period of time as permitted by law.

APPROVED March 20, 2017



Edward L. McCord, Mayor



R. Scott Tobias, President of Council



Brenda Carroll, Clerk/Fiscal Officer

**Village of Covington
Wastewater Treatment Facility - Phase 1 Improvements
Bid Date: February 28, 2017**

Construction Cost Estimate \$ 1,320,000
Per ORC 153.12, contract(s) shall not be in excess of 10% above the estimate.
Awardable Limit \$ 1,452,000

	PART A GEN'L CONSTRUCTION	PART B ELECTRICAL	COMBINATION BID
JUTTE EXCAVATING	NO BID	\$255,073.00	\$1,108,892.00
KIRK BROS	\$1,000,100.00	NO BID	\$1,266,100.00
DOLL LAYMAN	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,450,000.00
PETERSON	\$998,000.00	NO BID	\$1,228,000.00
LAKE ERIE	NO BID	\$285,454.00	NO BID
FRYMAN-KUCK	\$1,211,695.00	\$266,923.00	\$1,478,618.00

			Awardable?	
Combination Low Bid	\$1,108,892.00	JUTTE EXCAVATING	YES	APPARENT LOW BID

			Awardable?	
Part A Low Bid	\$998,000.00	PETERSON		
Part B Low Bid	\$255,073.00	JUTTE EXCAVATING		
Total	\$1,253,073.00		YES	